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Volcanic cinder cones, slow-paced

desert tortoises, wild west cattle

operations, booming sand dunes,
historic and modern mines, rock

formations etched with messages
fromformer residents, vast scenic
vistas framed by Joshua trees, this
is the Mojave National Preserve.

BACKGROUND

Signed into law by President Clinton on
October 31,1994, the California
Desert Protection Act created the 1.4

million acre Mojave National Preserve
- intheheartofthe Mojave Desert. The
act transferred the lands known as the

EastMojaveNational Scenic Area
from the Bureau of Land Management

to the National Park Service. The

National Park Service administers the

variety of ecosystems in the Mojave
National Preserve to preserve the
region's natural and cultural resources.

Congress enacted the California Desert
Protection Act to preserve the un
rivaled ecological, geological, cultural,
historical,wildlifeandrecreational

values of the California Desert.

THE DESERT

ENVIRONMENT

The desert in the Moj ave National
Preserve ranges in elevation from less
than 1,000 feet to almost 8,000 feet.

The best months for visiting are Octo-
berthroughMay. Summer daytime
temperatures average more than
100 degrees.

Thoughnotalways visible, wildlife is
abundant. The Mojave Desert is home

to nearly 300 different species of
animals, including desert bighorn sheep,
mule deer, coyotes and desert tor
toises. A variety ofbirds live in the
desert. Golden eagles and several
species of hawks can be seen soaring

SERVICE

on the thermal updrafts. Gambel'squail,
chukar and mourning doves, as well as
many other smaller species ofbirds live
in the canyons and washes where they
are able to find water, food and vegeta
tion for cover.

Desert plants are especially adapted to
living in this arid climate. Many have
small leaves withwaxy coverings to
minimize moisture loss, while cacti store

large volumesofwater. Otherplants
such as the creosote have developed
extensive or deep root systems that
enable them to gather the precious
water. Common plants include yucca,
creosote and the Joshua tree. Ifthe

winter rains have watered the desert,

wildflowers spread across the desert in
a rainbow of colors during April and
May.

Evidence of the people who have lived
and made a living from the desert and
its resources is scattered across the

region. Petroglyphsandpictographs
etched and drawn on the rocks

throughout the region are evidence of a
long history of the peoples who fol
lowed the natural cycles of plants and
animals, gatheringandhunting whatthey
needed to live. Later comers to the

desert left their marks too. Old mines,

ranches and even the ruts cut into the

desert floor by wagons remind us that

this "barren" land has drawn people to
its resources for more than 10,000

years. All historical objects and archeo-
logical features are protected by law.
Observe and enjoy them, but do not
disturb, damage or remove them.

EXPLORING THE

PRESERVE

The Mojave National Preserve is easily
accessible from either Interstate 15,

which forms most of its northem

boundary, or Interstate 40, which
creates its southem boundary. Visitors
can enjoy a picnic, a scenic drive, a
bike ride, a short hike or views of

spring wildflowers. Visitors can also
enjoy camping, stargazing or back
packing.

VISITOR CENTER AND

INTERPRETIVE

PROGRAMS

Additional information and maps are
available at the Moj ave Desert Infor
mation Center in Baker, California. Call

or visit for up-to-date information on
programs offered throughout the year.

The Mojave Desert Information Center
is open daily. Hole-in-the-Wall Infor
mation Center is open as staffing
permits.

National Park Service rangers patrol

the Preserve to provide information and
resource protection.

CAMPING

TheNational Park Service maintains

two campgrounds with water, tables,
and toilet facilities. Hole-in-the-Wall

campground (elevation4,200 ft.)
is located neartowering volcanic rocks
that have been sculpted by water and

wind. The campground, with some pull-
through sites, can accommodate

motorhomes and a dump station is
available.

Mid Hills campground (elevation 5,600
ft.) is located in apinon-juniper wood
land and offers excellent views of Cima

Dome from some ofthe sites.

Motorhomes longer than 26 feet may
have difficulty maneuvering in this
campground.




